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Abstract 

Corruption is as aged as the existence of man and it exists 
in all sphere of human life. The  persistency  of  
corruption  erodes  the  social  economic  value  of  a  
nation. The study investigates the relationship between 
corruption and economic growth in Nigeria, in the period 
1980-2013, using the VAR analysis. The study finds the 
existence of long-term relationship between corruption 
and unemployment growth on the economic growth of 
Nigeria. Also, the study found no short-term relationship 
in corruption and unemployment on economic growth. 
Hence, the result in the analysis shows that corruption 
positively has a strong influence on the output of Nigeria. 
So the rise in growth rate experienced in Nigeria is 
influenced by high corruption rate in the country, which 
is making the few rich to be richer, eradicating the middle 
class and making the poor to be poorer. Therefore, there is 
a need to develop political will to prosecute anyone found 
guilty of corruption irrespective of their position, tribe, 
religion or party affiliation. Such a punishment would 
also serve as a deterrent to others and help improve real 
economic growth and development. 
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Introduction 

Corruption is a universal problem faced by both the developing 
and the developed countries. Although, according to Volejníková 
(2009) corruption  was  not  given  an  explicit  recognition  in the  
traditional  economic  theories,  it  has  in  recent times  become  a  
globally  recognized  policy  variable especially in less developed 
countries. According to Transparency International Organization 
(TIO), corruption is the misuse of public power for personal 
interests. This phenomenon is the result of weaknesses in the 
economic, political, and institutional performance of government. 
Shaxson (2007) argues that transparency international’s definition 
of corruption is too narrow. While Knack (2007) states, that one 
cannot assign one definition to the work of Transparency 
International. The major obstacles to the comparative studies of 
corruption have been the lack of a general definition of corruption 
and the absence of objective cross-national data on corrupt 
behavior. Although corruption is more common in poorer 
economies, it does exist in all countries. Both economic growth and 
corruption are words that have been frequently used in public 
debates over the last few years. Economic growth is influenced by 
corruption either directly or indirectly through particular 
transmission channels. The aim of this paper is to study the impact 
of corruption on economic growth in Nigeria for the period 1980-
2013.  

The main rationale for embarking on this study came from a study 
by Selcuk Akcay (1999),which based his theoretical framework on 
the work of Mauro (1997). However, the present study differs in 
two aspects. Firstly, Selcuk Akcay (1999)examines the impact of 
corruption on economic growth across countries, for the period 
1960-1995. However, the present study examines the impact of 
corruption on economic growth in Nigeria, covering the 
period1980-2013. Secondly, new control variable such as inflation 
rate (proxy for macroeconomic instability), is added to the model of 
the present study. 

The second section of the paper describes corruption, its trends and 
classification globally and in Nigeria specifically. The third section 
reviews the literatures; the fourth section discusses issues in 
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formulating methodology, model specification and empirical 
methods. The fifth section shows the analysis of results obtained 
and the last section concludes, by recommending appropriate 
policy for implementation. 

Study background 

Corruption, as defined for the purpose of this study, is “the abuse 
of public office for private (economic) gain”. To a certain extent the 
corrupt practices that occur among private sector agents are 
excluded, although in practice both political and private corruption 
frequently overlaps. Corruption covers a considerable number of 
human actions, which in turn affect the operation of the Nigerian 
economy. Therefore, to analyze how corruption affects the 
economic growth in Nigeria, there is the need to unbundle 
corruption into specific human action. Corruption can be 
categorized in various dimensions to facilitate the understanding of 
how corruption affects economic growth. The concept includes 
three broad categories of human action: bribery, theft of public 
assets, and patronage. Corruption could be categorized based on 
how common and widespread it is and whether it is incidental or 
systemic. If corruption is perceived by the public as a regular 
behavior of public officials, then it is called “systemic”. 

Corruption is now recognized as a global phenomenon, which has 
to be addressed coherently and consistently. The need for 
concerted action in Africa is evident, and especially in Nigeria 
where corruption is said to be systemic. Corruption is deep rooted 
in Nigeria and its manifestation  is  reflected  in  the  nation’s  
scores  in Corruption  Perception  Index  (CIP)  published annually  
by  the  highly  rated  Transparency International  (TI). Nigerians 
were once universally respected and even honored. But, the 
question now is, what has changed? In order to take over the 
country from the Niger Company (Unilever) the British 
government paid 865,000 pounds, a huge amount in 1900. So 
frankly speaking, the British did not come to Nigeria to spread 
democracy because Nigeria started as a business to them. In the 
first republic (1963-1966), a politician who was the pre-
independence minister of labor and post-independence minister of 
finance was alleged to have increased tariff on imported shoes to 
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protect its shoe industry in Nigeria. This same person was 
financing the NCNC political party, and no one bothered to ask 
where he got the money from, but according to Arrow Smith the 
money came from multinational companies. He was also 
responsible for bringing Julius Berger to Nigeria, which 
constructed the Eko-bridge in Lagos. Unfortunately, his willingness 
and dealings represented the beginning of corrupt practices in 
Nigeria public office holders. The first military coup in Nigeria 
took place in 1966 and the reason given by the military men was 
that: “our enemies are the political profiteers, the swindlers, the 
men in high and low places, that seek bribes and demand 10%; 
those that seek to keep the country divided permanently so that 
they can remain in office as ministers or VIPs.” Sadly, the same 
reason was given in every other coup that occurred after. 

Despite the fact that Nigeria is blessed with an abundance of 
resources, particularly oil, and thereby considered a rich nation, it 
is not evident in the economy due to the presence of corruption in 
the country. African countries, including Nigeria, have to become 
more integrated into the global economy and attract greater levels 
of foreign and domestic investment if they are to achieve the 
growth rate necessary to reduce poverty and improve the well-
being of their populations. Though, these will only make it possible 
to limit and not altogether eradicate corruption and to reduce the 
corrosive effects it has on African nations and societies. 

Literature review 

In literature on corruption, there are two major thoughts. On one 
hand, it has been argued by researcher such as Douie 1917,Leff 
(1964), Morgan (1964), Bayley (1966),Nye (1967),Huntington (1968), 
Friedrich (1972),Summers (1977),Lui (1985) and Acemoglu and 
Verdier (1998), that corruption aids economic growth vis-à-vis 
efficiency, particularly in the case of cumbersome regulation, 
excessive bureaucracy, market restriction or inefficient policies. 
According to Pak Hung Mo (2000), Corruption works like piece-
rate pay for bureaucrats, which induces a more efficient provision 
of government services, and it provides a leeway for entrepreneurs 
to bypass inefficient regulations. From this perspective, corruption 
acts as a lubricant that smoothens operations hence, raises the 
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efficiency of an economy. On the other hand, researchers like: 
McMullan (1961), Myrdal (1968),Krueger (1974), Alam 
(1989),Vishny (1993),Mauro (1995), Tanzi (1997), andAliyu and 
Elijah (2008), argue that it reduces efficiency of the Economy. 
Corruption tends to hurt innovative activities because innovators 
need government-supplied goods, such as permits and import 
quotas, more than established producers do. Demand for these 
goods is high and inelastic; hence, they become primary targets of 
corruption Pak Hung Mo (2000). However, the actual effect of 
corruption on economic growth and its transmission process can be 
settled only empirically. 

In recent years, there has been considerable empirical study on the 
impact of corruption. The emergence of indices on corruption 
enables researchers to do empirical studies about causes and 
consequences of corruption. These empirical studies reveal that 
corruption reduces growth and investment, increases poverty and 
inequality and distorts allocation of resources. The first 
econometric study on the impact of corruption on economic growth 
and investment across countries was done by Mauro. Mauro (1995, 
1997) uses data from a sample of developed and developing 
countries to investigate the effects of corruption on economic 
growth, employing both Ordinary Least Squares (OLS) and 
Instrumental Variables (IV) estimating techniques. He finds that 
corruption has a negative and significant impact on economic 
growth. Most of the growth impact, he finds, comes through 
decreased investment in physical capita. Tanzi and Davoodi (1997) 
investigate the effects of corruption on economic growth and 
government expenditures. They find that corruption increases 
government expenditures but decreases expenditures on 
maintenance and thus leads to reduced economic growth. They 
also find that corruption decreases private investment. Gupta et al. 
(1998) find that corruption increases income inequality in a sample 
of developing countries. Hendriks et al. (1998) and Johnston (1998) 
find that the distributional effects of corruption and tax evasion are 
regressive, hence increases income inequality. Alesina and Weder 
(1999) investigate whether corrupt governments receive less foreign 
aid and conclude that corrupt governments receive more foreign 
aid under some circumstances. 
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Li et al. (2000) investigate the effects of corruption on income and 
the gini coefficient of income distribution using data from Asian, 
OECD, and Latin American countries. They find that corruption 
increases the gini coefficient in a quadratic way. Aliyu and Elijah 
(2008) investigated the impact of corruption on economic growth 
from 1986-2007. Engle-Granger co integration and error correction 
mechanism (ECM) techniques were employed. The results show 
that corruption has significant negative effect on economic growth. 
The study discovers that corruption exerts both direct and indirect 
negative effects on economic growth in Nigeria. Nageri et al (2013), 
the study investigated the impact of corruption on economic 
development in Nigeria. The data were analyzed using the 
Ordinary Least Square (OLS) regression technique. The findings 
show that corruption has a significant negative effect on economic 
growth and development. Rotimi Ekundayo Mathew et al (2013), it 
studied corruption and the Nigerian economic growth. This study 
used the ordinary least squares (OLS) to determine the relationship 
between corruption and economy growth. The results revealed that 
corruption impairs and impacts economic growth. It is on this 
basis, we draw our conclusion  and  suggest  that  Private  Anti-
Corruption  Initiatives,  Public  anti-corruption  initiatives and 
Public  education campaign/programs  should  be  strengthened  
and  motivated  to  address  the cause of corruption rather than its 
effects. Egunjobi (2013), this study empirically investigates the 
impact of corruption on economic growth in Nigeria on an annual 
time series data from 1980-2009 using regression analysis.  Also, the 
Granger causality test and impulse response function was carried 
out. The empirical results  reveal  that  corruption  per  worker 
exerts  a  negative  influence  on  output  per  worker  directly  and  
also  indirectly  on  foreign  private  investment, expenditure on 
education and capital expenditure per worker. The above empirical 
studies indicate best, mixed and conflicting results. This can be 
attributed in part to problems of methodology in these studies. For 
instance, while some of those studies used time series data, others 
used cross-national data thereby making it difficult to control for a 
number of cultural, historical, institutional, and qualitative 
differences in administrative rules and practices among others. 

This study seeks to contribute to literature, using time series 
Nigeria data because most of the study either uses cross sectional 
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or panel data to investigate the relationship between corruption 
and economic growth due to lack of corruption data. Obviously, 
the relationship between corruption and Economic growth remains 
ambiguous. As a result, the analysis of the impact of corruption on 
economic growth is very important for policy makers, in order to 
design appropriate anti-corruption policy. 

Methodology and Model specification 

In order to measure the impact of corruption on economic growth 
in Nigeria, the theoretical frame-work Selcuk Akcay (1999) is 
adopted for the analysis of this study, which based his theoretical 
framework on the work of Mauro (1997).Mauro (1995) extended 
Barro's framework by adding corruption to the growth equation. 
Mauro framework can be specified as follows: 

Gy(i,t) = - α  y( i,0)+ β corruption + control variables + ε    1.1 

Where; Gy(i,t) = is the growth rate of per capita GDP of a country i 
from period 0to period t.y( i,0) = is the log of a country's per capita 
GDP at time 0 in other words, Coefficient of y( i,0) is expected to be 
negative (-α) due to the theory of convergence. In estimating the 
relationship between corruption and growth, it is important to 
control other determinants of growth rate, to ensure that estimated 
coefficient capture the effect of corruption on growth. 

Taking inference from the empirical findings and theories, which 
has been derived from the theoretical exposition of theory of 
convergence and then making corruption central to the equation, a 
model will be drawn up to determine impact of corruption on 
economic growth in Nigeria. If corruption and other control 
variables are taken as an independent variable then the model can 
be stated as:   

RGDP=α0 + α1CORRt + α2CONSt + α3INFt + 4UNEMt+Ut…………1.2 

Where: RGDP=Real gross domestic product, CORRt=corruption 
perception index, CONSt=government consumption/expenditure, 
INFt=inflation, UNEM=unemployment growth. α1 to α4 represents 
the slope coefficients, α0 is the intercept and Ut is the stochastic 
term or the error term at time t. The study adopts VAR for the 
estimation of causal relationship between the variables. The data of 
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all the variables are sourced from the World development Indicator 
(WDI 2014). A-Priori expectation:α1> 0, α2< 0, α3< 0, and α4< 0. 
Causality Test 

Δ𝑅𝐺𝐷𝑃𝑡 = 𝛼𝑖𝑗 +  𝛼11𝑘
𝑚
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𝑚
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𝑚
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𝑚
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𝛼2𝑗 +  𝛼21𝑘

𝑚
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Δ𝐼𝑁𝐹𝑡 = 𝛼4𝑗 +  𝛼41𝑘
𝑚
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𝑚
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𝑚
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Analysis of result  

Table 1.1: Co integration Result 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Source: Computed by the researcher using E-view 7.0 

Hypothesized 
No. of CE(s) 

Eigen 
Value 

Trace 
Statistic 

0.05 Crit. 
Value 

Probability 

None* 0.858 111.955 69.819 0.000 

At most 1* 0.593 52.413 47.856 0.014 

At most 2 0.370 26.451 29.797 0.116 

At most 3 0.339 12.576 15.495 0.131 

At most 4 0.004 0.115 3.842 0.735 

Hypothesized 
No. of CE(s) 

Eigen 
Value 

Max-Eigen 
Statistic 

0.05 Crit. 
Value 

Probability 

None* 0.858 58.542 33.877 0.000 

At most 1 0.593 26.962 27.584 0.059 

At most 2 0.370 13.875 21.132 0.375 

At most 3 0.339 12.462 14.265 0.095 

At most 4 0.004 0.115 3.842 0.735 
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Table 1.1 above shows co integration test result. Both the trace test 
and the maximum-Eigen value test indicate two co integrating 
equations at 5% critical value. These indicate that null hypothesis of 
no co integration can be rejected at 5% critical value for both the 
trace test and maximum-Eigen value test. Therefore, Johansen co 
integration test shows evidence of long-run relationship between 
the variables considered. Usually, for variables that are co 
integrated, error correction model based causality test is employed 
to identify the direction of both short-run and long-run causality. 

 

Table 1.2: Long-run causality 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Source: Computed by the researcher using E-view 7.0 

 

Table 1.2 above shows that t-statistics value of corruption and 
unemployment growth are statistically significant in the real GDP 
equation and inflation equation. These indicate the existence of 
long-run causality, from the corruption and unemployment growth 
to real GDP and inflation respectively. Corruption has positive 
long-run relationship with both GDP and inflation. Unemployment 
growth has negative long-run relationship with GDP and positive 
long-run relationship with inflation. Also, government 
consumption t-stat. is significant in inflation equation but not 
significant in real GDP equation.  

  

Long-run  Causality CointEq1 CointEq2 

Real GDP (-1) 1.000 0.000 

Inflation(-1) 0.000 1.000 

Consumption (-1) -0.033 [-0.331] -7.049[-7.089] 

Corruption (-1) 0.355 [-3.669] 5.787 [1.853] 

Unemployment (-1) -1.077 [-3.669] 25.354 [8.714] 

 



Artha J Soc Sci                                                                               ISSN 0975-329X 
 

10 
 

Table: 1.3 Short-run causality 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Source: Computed by the researcher using E-view 7.0 

Table 1.3 shows that the t-statistics value of government 
consumption and corruption are not statistically significant in real 
GDP and inflation equation while, unemployment grow this not 
statistically significant in the real GDP equation but significant in 
the inflation equation. These indicate that there is no short-run 
relationship between government consumption, corruption and 
unemployment on economic growth. Unemployment has short-run 
relationship with inflation. 

Conclusion and policy recommendation 

Corruption is a significant social and ethical problem that has an 
important impact on all societies. It is a phenomenon that exists in 
many countries and constitutes a problem for the economy. 
Economists and various researchers in recent years have shown a 
major interest in studying the phenomenon of corruption and its 
influences on the economic growth and development. Therefore, 
this study employs causality technique to investigate corruption 
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[-0.663] 

0.006 
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and economic growth in Nigeria from 1980 to 2013.The empirical 
findings indicate that unit root test shows that the series are 
integrated at first difference. Since the series are integrated in the 
same order, co integration test was carried out which shows that a 
long-run co-integrating relationship exists between the variables. 
Hence, Error correction test was performed on variables that have 
long-run co integration relationship. Furthermore, the time-series 
analysis result shows that corruption and unemployment growth 
has positive long-run relationship with GDP. Also, the empirics 
reveal that government consumption, corruption and 
unemployment growth have no short-run relationship with real 
GDP. Therefore, the result in the analysis shows that corruption has 
a strong influence on the output of Nigeria. From the results 
obtained therein are used to draw a number of policy 
recommendation and conclusions. 

The quality of political structure is an important determinant of the 
economic behavior of the people in a country and will also explain 
the economic performance of the country. Corruption is one of the 
main reasons for institutional failure that characterizes developing 
countries and leads to destabilizing their long-term economic 
growth. Therefore, there is a need to formulate and implement 
policy that will reduce the negative effects of corruption to the 
nearest minimum. Some such appropriate policy response to 
corruption should also focus on the punishment of perpetrators 
and pursue preventive policies i.e. reducing opportunities and 
incentives to engage in corrupt practices. First, the quality of 
governance in Nigeria is low. As a result priority should be given 
to policy that will reform the regulatory quality, rule of law, 
government effectiveness and other pertinent governance 
characteristics. There is a need to entrench good governance in 
every sphere of government activities which is a sine-qua-non for 
poverty reduction in Nigerian society. It is not enough for political 
office holders and other government functionaries to preach that 
the government has zero tolerance for corruption. They should 
visibly exhibit accountability, transparency, fiscal responsibility 
and respect for the rule of law while carrying out their official 
responsibilities. It is important to note that instituting good 
governance entails replacing the existing weak institutions in the 
country with strong ones. Secondly, rule of law need to be 
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guaranteed in order to protect human rights. Also, there is a need 
to ensure governmental predictability. Court rulings have to be 
protected from political interference and judicial independence has 
to be assured. Successful policy reform in these will help reduce the 
incidence of corruption as well. A functioning and professional 
legal system and access to justice are also necessary, in 
strengthening the rule of law. Also, anticorruption policy should 
focus on detection and implementation of appropriate sanctions. 
Third, there is the need to strengthen institutions such as the civil 
service, EFCC, ICPC, CCB and other institution that can champion 
the course of anticorruption, which in turn will create interlocking 
systems of oversight and self-regulation. These institutions have to 
be free of corruption themselves and should be active in the fight 
against corruption. For instance, there is a need for equitable 
reward for workers, where hard work should be adequately 
compensated and recognized in all facets of our national life. 
Institutions which are primarily saddled with responsibility of 
curbing corruption like: ICPC and EFCC should be adequately 
staffed, funded and devoid of political interference. Lastly, the fight 
against corruption should include moral education, as values and 
norms of a society play an important role in the shaping of 
individuals. And the re-orientation of the people in the society can 
best be made possible with the help of media, and the people 
themselves. 

In conclusion, based on the findings of this study, it is therefore 
recommended that the new government in power should know 
that “business can never be as usual” but rather “business and 
usual”. Therefore, policy holders and other officials should engage 
in measures that will curb corruption, these measures include: 
Increasing efforts aimed at providing adequate information about 
the long-run negative impacts of corruption, more severe measures 
against corruption should be adopted ensuring that public funds 
are not embezzled. Such measures could include: examination of 
records and independent auditing. Conclusively,  Government  
should  improve  her  political  determination  to  fight  corruption  
to  a  standstill  in  the  economy. Existing exertions by government 
are producing good outcomes, but there is still a need to expand on 
these measures due to the complex nature of Nigeria. 
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